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Percentage of women married before age 18 (World 
Development Indicators)

Does a woman's testimony carry the same evidentiary 
weight in court as a man's? (Women Business and the 
Law)

Can women interact freely with men in a business 
context? (Women Business and the Law)

There is no legal provision that requires a married 
woman to obey her husband (Women Business and 
the Law) 

Can a woman be head of household in the same way 
as a man? (Women Business and the Law)

Do married couples jointly share legal responsibility 
for financially maintaining the family's expenses? 
(Women Business and the Law)

Do men and women have equal ownership rights to 
immovable property?  (Women Business and the Law)

Do women have equal access to register property, as 
part of property rights index? (Women Business and 
the Law)

Do sons and daughters have equal rights to inherit 
assets from their parents? (Women Business and the 
Law)

Do female and male surviving spouses have equal 
rights to inherit assets? (Women Business and the 
Law)

Does the law provide for the valuation of nonmonetary 
contributions (i.e., unpaid domestic work)? (Women 
Business and the Law)

Can a woman legally open a bank account in the same 
way as a man? (Women Business and the Law) 

Does the law prohibit discrimination in access to credit 
based on gender? (Women Business and the Law)

Can a woman sign a contract in the same way as a 
man? (Women Business and the Law)

Can a woman register a business in the same way as a 
man? (Women Business and the Law) 

Can a woman get a job in the same way as a man? 
(Women Business and the Law) 

Can women work in jobs deemed dangerous in the 
same way as men? (Women Business and the Law)

Are men and women separated from working together 
at employment locations? (Women Business and the 
Law)

Does the law prohibit discrimination in employment 
based on gender? (Women Business and the Law)

Is there legislation on sexual harassment in 
employment? (Women Business and the Law)

Does the government support or provide childcare 
services? (Women Business and the Law)

Are there criminal penalties or civil remedies for 
sexual harassment in employment? (Women Business 
and the Law)

Are there enabling policy frameworks/data legislation 
to support long-term investments in new technology 
solutions and applications, such as the use and 
protection of big data? (GSMA)

Does the law mandate equal remuneration for work of 
equal value? (Women Business and the Law)

Are women able to work in the same industries as 
men? (Women Business and the Law)

Are childcare payments tax-deductible? (Women 
Business and the Law)

Does the law grant spouses equal administrative 
authority over assets during marriage? (Women 
Business and the Law)
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